
SEO Guide:
Content Gap
Analysis

How to use a gap
analysis to land
10x more backlink
opportunities.  



Why Use a
Content Gap
Analysis?



Most outreach emails stink. 
And if you want to earn
links from real websites
with real authority, YOU
need to provide value first. 

please add my link to your
post

I spent the time
researching your current
content strategy and
benchmarked it against
competitors. I found XX
opportunities in this niche
vertical. 



How to Perform a
Content Gap
Analysis in 5
Steps: 



Open an SEO tool like
Semrush. Use their "keyword
gap" feature: 

1) Competitor Domains

Plug in the domain you are
doing outreach to, and 2-3 of
their competitors. 



Select "weak" or "missing"
keywords. This shows you a list
of keywords that your
outreach target is not ranking
well for against competitors: 

2) Find Weak Spots 



Filter for keyword difficulty,
finding opportunities that will
actually drive results: 

3) Filter Results 



Take it a step further: use
advanced filters for CPC,
intent, and more: 

4) Advanced Filters

Using this data, you now have
the perfect pitch to your
outreach target! 



Write a great email that gets
your pitch accepted. Steal this
template:

5) Email Draft / Copy



Now sit back,
relax, and watch
the pitch
acceptances
flood in.

Stop asking for
links. Start
providing value!


